CITY OF KALAMAZOO BID TAB

Bid Opening:

July 7, 2010 @ 3:30 p.m.

Bid Ref #: 458-01-502/NL (052)

Opened by:
Recorded by: Lee Larson

Nicholas Lam

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Rehab of 718 Elizabeth, 623 Fairbanks, 1114 Lane and 1404 Washington

Attended by:

Daniel and Kimberly, Kenn Hartmann, Marv Van Ousten

William Gothard

Paramount
Building Group

Honey Bear
Home Improv

Brick Stone

Construction

Kalamazoo

Konstruction

Home

Weatherization

Professional

Bldg

Item Description Contract Sum Contract Sum Contract Sum Contract Sum Contract Sum Contract Sum Contract Sum
1 |718 Elizabeth $ 89,500.00 No Bid No Bid $ 138,803.00 [ $ 126,500.00 | $ 104,200.00 | $ 93,600.00
work shall start within 10 days 14 days 30 days 15 days 15 days
completed within 90 days 75 days 90 days 90 days 90 days
2 [623 Fairbanks $ 89,500.00 No Bid No Bid $ 133,561.00 |$ 122,500.00 | $ 111,600.00 [ $ 145,950.00
work shall start within 10 days 14 days 30 days 15 days 15 days
completed within 90 days 75 days 90 days 90 days 90 days
3 [1114 Lane $ 89,500.00 No Bid $ 88,500.00 |$ 142,415.00 ($ 132,750.00 |$ 109,900.00 | $ 123,420.00
work shall start within 10 days 10 days 14 days 30 days 15 days 15 days
completed within 90 days 60 days 75 days 90 days 90 days 90 days
4 1404 Washington $ 89,500.00 | $ 131,750.00 No Bid $ 136,214.00 | $ 129,750.00 | $ 108,100.00 [ $ 145,530.00
work shall start within 10 days 21 days 14 days 30 days 15 days 15 days
completed within 90 days 90 days 75 days 90 days 90 days 90 days




CITY OF KALAMAZOO BID TAB
Bid Opening: July 7, 2010 @ 3:30 p.m.
Bid Ref #: 458-01-502/NL (052)

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER
Rehab of 718 Elizabeth, 623 Fairbanks, 1114 Lane and 1404 Washington

Across the Able All Star Innovative KLO
Jeffrey Michael Board LLC Vestal Builders | Construction Remodeling Builders Construction

Iltem Description Contract Sum [ Contract Sum | Contract Sum | Contract Sum | Contract Sum [ Contract Sum | Contract Sum

718 Elizabeth $ 114,926.00 | $ 103,865.00 | $ 87,000.00 | $ 120,250.00 |$ 136,764.00 [ $ 141,000.00 No Bid

work shall start within 60 days 14 days 30 days 10 days 14 days 15 days

completed within 120 days 65 days 90 days 90 days 90 days 90 days

623 Fairbanks $ 119,926.00 | $ 105,985.00 | $ 88,780.00 | $ 129,990.00 ($ 129,774.00|$ 135,000.00|$ 117,715.00

work shall start within 60 days 14 days 30 days 10 days 14 days 15 days 21 days

completed within 120 days 65 days 90 days 90 days 90 days 90 days 160 days

1114 Lane $ 130,000.00 | $ 117,355.00 [ $ 89,680.00 No Bid $ 149,244.00 | $ 150,000.00 No Bid

work shall start within 90 days 14 days 30 days 14 days 15 days

completed within 180 days 65 days 90 days 90 days 90 days

1404 Washington $ 130,000.00 | $ 97,875.00 | $ 88,560.00 No Bid $ 134,094.00 | $ 138,000.00 | $ 90,480.00

work shall start within 90 days 14 days 30 days 14 days 15 days 21 days

completed within 180 days 65 days 90 days 90 days 90 days 160 days




CITY OF KALAMAZOO BID TAB
Bid Opening: July 7, 2010 @ 3:30 p.m.
Bid Ref #: 458-01-502/NL (052)

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER
Rehab of 718 Elizabeth, 623 Fairbanks, 1114 Lane and 1404 Washington

Economy Cosey
Construction Construction
Item Description Contract Sum | Contract Sum
1 |718 Elizabeth $ 78,000.00 | $ 88,618.11
work shall start within 30 days
completed within 90 days
2 1623 Fairbanks $ 158,405.00 | $ 135,355.16
work shall start within 30 days
completed within 120 days
3 |1114 Lane $ 125255.00 |$ 121,811.68
work shall start within 30 days
completed within 120 days
1404 Washington $ 133,770.00 | $ 129,898.87
work shall start within 30 days
completed within 90 days




