
NO PUBLIC BID OPENING - COVID-19 ADDENDUM
 

Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Amount Unit Price Total Amount

1 Mobilization and Site Prep 1 LS $61,305.00 $61,305.00 NO BID NO BID

2 Construction Barrier Fence (Refer to 02-00-01) 500 LF $5.00 $2,500.00 NO BID NO BID

3 Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS $5,738.00 $5,738.00 NO BID NO BID

4 Construction Entrance (Refer to 02-00-02) 60 SY $30.00 $1,800.00 NO BID NO BID

5 Construction Layout and Staking (Refer to 02-00-03) 1 LS $9,450.00 $9,450.00 NO BID NO BID

6 Soil Erosion and Sediment Control (Refer to 02-00-04) 1 LS $35,530.00 $35,530.00 NO BID NO BID

7 Sheet pile Weir & Abutment Removal (Refer to 02-00-05) 1 LS $95,210.00 $95,210.00 NO BID NO BID

8 Bulk Earthwork (Refer to 02-00-06) 3,700 CYD $30.50 $112,850.00 NO BID NO BID

9 Fine Grading (Refer to 02-00-07) 1,100 CYD $0.01 $11.00 NO BID NO BID

10 Brush Toe (Refer to 02-00-08) 257 LF $131.10 $33,692.70 NO BID NO BID

11 Toe Wood (Refer to 02-00-09) 100 LF $162.70 $16,270.00 NO BID NO BID

12
Variable Constructed Riffles – Includes Sub Pavement (Refer to 

02-00-10)
879 SY $55.30 $48,608.70 NO BID NO BID

13 Erosion Control Blanket (Refer to 02-00-11) 1,050 SYD $5.15 $5,407.50 NO BID NO BID

14 Seeding and Mulching Zone 1 (Refer to 02-00-12) 2 AC $4,650.00 $7,905.00 NO BID NO BID

15   Seeding and Mulching Zone 2 (Refer to 02-00-12) 2 AC $3,100.00 $6,200.00 NO BID NO BID

16 Live Stakes (Refer to 02-00-13) 800 EA $6.15 $4,920.00 NO BID NO BID

17 Natural Stone Outfall Stabilization (Refer to 02-00-14) 30 TN $100.00 $3,000.00 NO BID NO BID

18 Removal of Trees 7 EA $471.50 $3,300.50 NO BID NO BID

*PRICE CORRECTED TO MATCH UNIT PRICING

NO BID$453,698.40

CITY OF KALAMAZOO BID TAB
BID OPENING: October 13, 2020 @ 3:30 PM

TOTAL BID AMOUNT

Hoffman Bros., Inc.

Bid WITH Prevailing Wages Bid Without Prevailing Wages

BID REF#: 95939-001.0; Milham Park Dam Removal

ATTENDED BY:Opened by: Craig Hull
Recorded by: Monica Johnson

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER



NO PUBLIC BID OPENING - COVID-19 ADDENDUM
 

CITY OF KALAMAZOO BID TAB
BID OPENING: October 13, 2020 @ 3:30 PM

Hoffman Bros., Inc.

BID REF#: 95939-001.0; Milham Park Dam Removal

ATTENDED BY:Opened by: Craig Hull
Recorded by: Monica Johnson

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Amount Unit Price Total Amount

1 Mobilization and Site Prep 1 LS $18,278.59 $18,278.59 $18,152.83 $18,152.83

2 Construction Barrier Fence (Refer to 02-00-01) 500 LF $4.61 $2,305.00 $3.77 $1,885.00

3 Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS $15,961.27 $15,961.27 $15,157.85 $15,157.85

4 Construction Entrance (Refer to 02-00-02) 60 SY $40.66 $2,439.60 $36.19 $2,171.40

5 Construction Layout and Staking (Refer to 02-00-03) 1 LS $13,049.68 $13,049.68 $13,236.32 $13,236.32

6 Soil Erosion and Sediment Control (Refer to 02-00-04) 1 LS $2,154.58 $2,154.58 $2,108.02 $2,108.02

7 Sheet pile Weir & Abutment Removal (Refer to 02-00-05) 1 LS $62,206.46 $62,206.46 $53,823.85 $53,823.85

8 Bulk Earthwork (Refer to 02-00-06) 3,700 CYD $11.81 $43,697.00 $9.66 $35,742.00

9 Fine Grading (Refer to 02-00-07) 1,100 CYD $14.57 $16,027.00 $11.66 $12,826.00

10 Brush Toe (Refer to 02-00-08) 257 LF $350.37 $90,045.09 $333.84 $85,796.88

11 Toe Wood (Refer to 02-00-09) 100 LF $561.43 $56,143.00 $546.28 $54,628.00

12
Variable Constructed Riffles – Includes Sub Pavement (Refer to 

02-00-10)
879 SY $121.14 $106,482.06 $112.84 $99,186.36

13 Erosion Control Blanket (Refer to 02-00-11) 1,050 SYD $5.81 $6,100.50 $5.90 $6,195.00

14 Seeding and Mulching Zone 1 (Refer to 02-00-12) 2 AC $13,702.16 $23,293.67 $13,898.14 $23,626.84

15   Seeding and Mulching Zone 2 (Refer to 02-00-12) 2 AC $14,275.98 $28,551.96 $14,328.84 $28,657.68

16 Live Stakes (Refer to 02-00-13) 800 EA $9.79 $7,832.00 $9.93 $7,944.00

17 Natural Stone Outfall Stabilization (Refer to 02-00-14) 30 TN $394.44 $11,833.20 $359.72 $10,791.60

18 Removal of Trees 7 EA $2,142.86 $15,000.02 $2,142.86 $15,000.02

*PRICE CORRECTED TO MATCH UNIT PRICING

TOTAL BID AMOUNT $521,400.68 $486,929.65

Bid WITH Prevailing Wages Bid Without Prevailing Wages

Taplin Enterprises, LLC



NO PUBLIC BID OPENING - COVID-19 ADDENDUM
 

CITY OF KALAMAZOO BID TAB
BID OPENING: October 13, 2020 @ 3:30 PM

Hoffman Bros., Inc.

BID REF#: 95939-001.0; Milham Park Dam Removal

ATTENDED BY:Opened by: Craig Hull
Recorded by: Monica Johnson

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Amount Unit Price Total Amount

1 Mobilization and Site Prep 1 LS $375,000.00 $375,000.00 $375,000.00 $375,000.00

2 Construction Barrier Fence (Refer to 02-00-01) 500 LF $5.00 $2,500.00 $5.00 $2,500.00

3 Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

4 Construction Entrance (Refer to 02-00-02) 60 SY $115.00 $6,900.00 $115.00 $6,900.00

5 Construction Layout and Staking (Refer to 02-00-03) 1 LS $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00

6 Soil Erosion and Sediment Control (Refer to 02-00-04) 1 LS $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00

7 Sheet pile Weir & Abutment Removal (Refer to 02-00-05) 1 LS $49,600.00 $49,600.00 $49,600.00 $49,600.00

8 Bulk Earthwork (Refer to 02-00-06) 3,700 CYD $40.00 $148,000.00 $40.00 $148,000.00

9 Fine Grading (Refer to 02-00-07) 1,100 CYD $30.00 $33,000.00 $30.00 $33,000.00

10 Brush Toe (Refer to 02-00-08) 257 LF $180.00 $46,260.00 $180.00 $46,260.00

11 Toe Wood (Refer to 02-00-09) 100 LF $430.00 $43,000.00 $430.00 $43,000.00

12
Variable Constructed Riffles – Includes Sub Pavement (Refer to 

02-00-10)
879 SY $95.00 $83,505.00 $95.00 $83,505.00

13 Erosion Control Blanket (Refer to 02-00-11) 1,050 SYD $5.00 $5,250.00 $5.00 $5,250.00

14 Seeding and Mulching Zone 1 (Refer to 02-00-12) 2 AC $11,600.00 $19,720.00 $11,600.00 $19,720.00

15   Seeding and Mulching Zone 2 (Refer to 02-00-12) 2 AC $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00

16 Live Stakes (Refer to 02-00-13) 800 EA $10.00 $8,000.00 $10.00 $8,000.00

17 Natural Stone Outfall Stabilization (Refer to 02-00-14) 30 TN $110.00 $3,300.00 $110.00 $3,300.00

18 Removal of Trees 7 EA $550.00 $3,850.00 $550.00 $3,850.00

*PRICE CORRECTED TO MATCH UNIT PRICING

TOTAL BID AMOUNT $906,385.00 $906,385.00

Davis Construction, Inc.

Bid WITH Prevailing Wages Bid Without Prevailing Wages



NO PUBLIC BID OPENING - COVID-19 ADDENDUM
 

CITY OF KALAMAZOO BID TAB
BID OPENING: October 13, 2020 @ 3:30 PM

Hoffman Bros., Inc.

BID REF#: 95939-001.0; Milham Park Dam Removal

ATTENDED BY:Opened by: Craig Hull
Recorded by: Monica Johnson

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Amount Unit Price Total Amount

1 Mobilization and Site Prep 1 LS $144,830.00 $144,830.00 $136,000.00 $136,000.00

2 Construction Barrier Fence (Refer to 02-00-01) 500 LF $3.00 $1,500.00 $2.70 $1,350.00

3 Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS $4,538.00 $4,538.00 $4,600.00 $4,600.00

4 Construction Entrance (Refer to 02-00-02) 60 SY $82.15 $4,929.00 $78.65 $4,719.00

5 Construction Layout and Staking (Refer to 02-00-03) 1 LS $65,820.00 $65,820.00 $65,900.00 $65,900.00

6 Soil Erosion and Sediment Control (Refer to 02-00-04) 1 LS $30,240.00 $30,240.00 $27,900.00 $27,900.00

7 Sheet pile Weir & Abutment Removal (Refer to 02-00-05) 1 LS $39,223.00 $39,223.00 $35,900.00 $35,900.00

8 Bulk Earthwork (Refer to 02-00-06) 3,700 CYD $101.00 $373,700.00 $96.85 $358,345.00

9 Fine Grading (Refer to 02-00-07) 1,100 CYD $42.00 $46,200.00 $39.95 $43,945.00

10 Brush Toe (Refer to 02-00-08) 257 LF $408.00 $104,856.00 $390.00 $100,230.00

11 Toe Wood (Refer to 02-00-09) 100 LF $579.00 $57,900.00 $553.00 $55,300.00

12
Variable Constructed Riffles – Includes Sub Pavement (Refer to 

02-00-10)
879 SY $251.00 $220,629.00 $245.50 $215,794.50

13 Erosion Control Blanket (Refer to 02-00-11) 1,050 SYD $5.10 $5,355.00 $4.90 $5,145.00

14 Seeding and Mulching Zone 1 (Refer to 02-00-12) 2 AC $13,915.00 $23,655.50 $12,800.00 $21,760.00

15   Seeding and Mulching Zone 2 (Refer to 02-00-12) 2 AC $16,812.00 $33,624.00 $15,219.00 $30,438.00

16 Live Stakes (Refer to 02-00-13) 800 EA $18.65 $14,920.00 $17.20 $13,760.00

17 Natural Stone Outfall Stabilization (Refer to 02-00-14) 30 TN $682.00 $20,460.00 $663.00 $19,890.00

18 Removal of Trees 7 EA $501.00 $3,507.00 $500.00 $3,500.00

TOTAL BID AMOUNT $1,195,886.50 $1,144,476.50

*PRICE CORRECTED TO MATCH UNIT PRICING

E.T. MacKenzie Company

Bid WITH Prevailing Wages Bid Without Prevailing Wages


