CITY OF KALAMAZOO BID TAB
Bid Opening: August 25, 2022 @ 3:00 p.m.
Bid Ref #: 75000-003.0

THIS IS NOT AN ORDER

Miscellaneous Aggregates & Road Gravel

Opened/Recorded by: Gracia Mason Attended By: None
High Grade Materials Top Grade Ag_g@ate Industries
Est
Annual PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER
Item Description | Qty/Tons TON TOTAL TON TOTAL TON TOTAL
Group I|#4 Ice Control
A|Sand - Washed 6,000] $ 6.25 37,500.00 | $ 550 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 7.47 44,820.00
23A Stabilized
B|Road Gravel 1,000] $ 7.50 7,500.00 N/A $ - no bid -
21AA Crushed
Stone, MDOT
C|spec 1,000] $ 19.00 19,000.00 | $ 2400 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 16.47 16,470.00
21AA Crushed
D|Concrete 1,000] $ 14.00 14,000.00 | $ 1250 | $ 12,500.00 no bid -
22A Road
Gravel, MDOT
E|spec 1,000] $ 7.50 7,500.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 8.47 8,470.00
Class Il Sand,
FIMDOT spec 1,000] $ 3.35 3,350.00 | $ 385|% 3,850.00 | $ 4.97 4,970.00
10,000 Qty
G|[Hauling Charge 11,000] $ 4.50 49,500.00 |@ $6.30 $ 63,000.00 | $ 9.00 99,000.00
Options|Delivery by
H|Tandem Axles ADD| $ 3.75 $ 12.50 $ -
Delivery by
I{Double Bottom ADD| $ - $ 4.50 $ -
TOTAL GROUP I| $ 138,350.00 | $ 146,350.00 | $ 173,730.00
Group Il
A|Pea Gravel 100] $ 22.25 2,225.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 13.47 1,347.00
B|6A Stone 500] $ 25.72 12,860.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ 17.00 8,500.00
6AA Crushed
C|Natural Stone 500] $ 30.00 15,000.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 14,000.00 no bid -
D[Hauling Charge 1,100] $ 3.75 4,125.00 | $ 6.30 | $ 6,930.00 | $ 9.00 9,900.00
Options|Delivery by
E|Tandem Axles ADD] $ 3.75 $ 12.50 $ -
Delivery by
F|Double Bottom ADD] $ - $ 4.50 $ -
TOTAL GROUP II| $ 34,210.00 | $ 30,830.00 | $ 19,747.00
Group llI{Rip-Rap -
A|Medium 500] no bid - | nobid $ - 1% 29.00 14,500.00
Rip-Rap -
B[Heavy 500] no bid - | no bid $ - 15 29.00 14,500.00
C|Hauling Charge 1,000] no bid - | no bid $ - FOB Only -
Options|Delivery by
D|Tandem Axles ADD| $ - $ - $ -
Delivery by
E|Double Bottom ADD| $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL GROUP Il no bid no bid| $ 29,000.00

Pit location

Doster Pit, 265 E. M89, Plainwell, Ml

1100 Nazareth, Kalamazoo, Ml

Kal West Plant 6000 West G Ave, Kal, Ml

Deliveries made within

hours

48 hours

60 Business
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